ORDINANCE #2023-07
AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 11, BUILDING REGULATIONS
OF THE REVISED ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF PHILIP, SD

Be it Ordained by the City Council of the City of Philip, South Dakota, that the following Sections in
Chapter 11, Building Code, are hereby amended and adopted — with strikethreugh indicating text to be
deleted, underline indicating text to be added, and the remainder of the Chapter left unaffected — as
follows:

11-102.1 BUILDING CODE ADOPTED

The common council hereby adopts the 2021 International Residential Code for One- and
Two-Family Dwellings, Chapters 1-10 and 12-24 and 44 and the 2021 International
Building Code as published by the International Code Council. A copy of the code shall be
on file in the City Office.

11-102.1.1 AMENDMENTS TO THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE (IRC)
The following amendments to the International Residential Code for One- and Two-Family
Dwellings adopted by section 6-26 are made and incorporated into the code:

CLIMATIC AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA
City of Philip, SD

Ground Snow Load 40

Wind Speed (mph) 115

Seismic Design Category A

Subject to Damage From:

Weathering Severe

Frost Line Depth 42"

Termite None to Slight
Decay None to Slight
Winter Design Temperature (f) -7

Ice Shield Under-underlayment Required Yes

Flood Hazards NFIP

Air Freezing Index 3000

Mean Annual Temperature 42

IRC Chapter 1, Section R105 Permits.
1. IRC Chapter 1, Section 105.1 Required is hereby amended to read as follows: Any
owner or owner’s authorized agent who intends to construct, enlarge, move, or change




[~

|wo

Ea

|

|~

the occupancy of a building or structure shall first make application to the city of Philip
and obtain the required permit.

IRC Chapter 1, Section R105.2 Work exempt from building permit is hereby amended

to read as follows: Building Permits shall not be required for the following. Exemption

from the permit requirements of this code shall not be deemed to grant authorization for

any work to be done in any manner in violation of the provisions of this code or any

other laws or ordinances of this jurisdiction.

1. One-story detached accessory structures provided the floor area does not exceed two

hundred (200) square feet. Setback requirements from zoning are still required to

be met.

Fences not over seven (7) feet high.

3. Retaining walls that are not over four (4) feet in height measured from grade on the

exposed side to the top of the wall, unless supporting a surcharge.

4. Water tanks supported directly upon grade if the capacity does not exceed 5,000
gallons and the ratio of height to diameter or width does not exceed 2 to one 1.

5. Sidewalks and driveways.

6. Painting, papering, tiling carpeting, cabinets, countertops and similar finish work.

7. Above ground prefabricated swimming pools.

8

9

N

. Swings and other playground equipment.
._Window awnings supported by an exterior wall which do not project more than 54
inches from the exterior wall and do not require additional support.
10. Replacement of similar siding materials.
11. Replacement of similar roofing materials.
12. Gutters, downspouts, and storm windows.
13. Window replacement where the rough opening is not altered.
14. Structures or work performed on properties of the government of the United States
of America or the State of South Dakota.
15. Decks that are not more than 30 inches above grade at any point.
16. Interior remodeling.

IRC Chapter 3, Section R302.5.1 Opening protection. Openings from a private garage
directly into a room used for sleeping purposes shall not be permitted. Other openings
between the garage and residence shall be equipped with solid wood doors not less than
1 3/8 inches in thickness, solid or honeycomb-core steel doors not less than 1 3/8
inches thick, or 20-minute fire-rated doors. Doors shall be equipped with a self-closing
device.

IRC Chapter 3, Section R302.13 Fire protection of floors is hereby deleted.

IRC Chapter 3, Section 313 Automatic fire sprinkler systems is hereby deleted. IRC
Chapter 3, Section R313.2.1 Design and installation is hereby amended. When
installed an Automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall be designed and installed
in accordance with Section P2904 or NFPA 13D.

IRC Chapter 4, Section 403.1.4.1 exception 1. Frost Protection of freestanding
accessory structures with an area of 1,024 square feet or less, of light-framed
construction, with an eve height of ten (10) feet or less shall not be required.

Chapter 11 Enerqy Efficiency. Chapter 11 is hereby deleted and not adopted by the
city.




11.102.1.2

2021 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE (IBC)

The following amendments to the International Building Code hereby adopted and
incorporated into the code:

1. Section 105 Permits.

(1) IBC Chapter 1, Section A105.1 Required is hereby amended to read as follows:
Any owner or owner’s authorized agent who intends to construct, enlarge, move, or
change the occupancy of a building or structure shall first make application to the city
and obtain the required permit.

(2) IBC Chapter 1, Section R105.2 Work exempt from permit is hereby amended to
read as follows: Permits shall not be required for the following. Exemption from the
permit requirements of this code shall not be deemed to grant authorization for any
work to be done in any manner in violation of the provisions of this code or any other
laws or ordinances of this jurisdiction.

a. One-story detached accessory structures provided the floor area does not exceed

one hundred twenty (200) square feet.

b. Fences not over seven (7) feet high.

c. Retaining walls that are not over four (4) feet in height measured from grade on the

exposed side to the top of the wall, unless supporting a surcharge.

d. Water tanks supported directly upon grade if the capacity does not exceed 5,000
gallons and the ratio of height to diameter or width does not exceed 2 to one 1.
Sidewalks and driveways.

Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets, counter tops and similar finish work.
. Above ground prefabricated swimming pools.

Swings and other playground equipment.

Window awnings supported by an exterior wall which do not project more than 54

inches from the exterior wall and do not require additional support.

Gultters, downspouts, and storm windows.

Window replacement where the rough opening is not altered.

Replacement of similar siding materials.

. Replacement of similar roofing materials.

Structures or work performed on properties of the government of the United States

of America or the State of South Dakota.
p. Interior remodeling and repairs.

—|=tQ |~k (D

o IR

(3) _IBC Chapter 1, Section 113 Board of Appeals is hereby amended to read as
follows: The board of adjustment shall be the Board of Appeals.

(a) Whenever the word "jurisdiction" is used in the code adopted by section 11-102.1, it
shall be held to mean the City of Philip, South Dakota.

(b) Whenever the term "corporate counsel” is used in the code, it shall be held to mean

11-102.2 DEFINITIONS IN CODE
the city attorney.
11-102.3 CONFLICTS

In the event of any conflict between the provisions of the code adopted in section11-
102.1 and applicable provisions of this Code of Ordinances, state law or city ordinance,




the provisions of this Code of Ordinances, state law, or city ordinance shall prevail and be
controlling.

11-102.4 INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING CODE ADOPTED
The common council hereby adopts the 2021 International Existing Building Code

published by the International Code Council.

11-102-5 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE ADOPTED
The common council hereby adopts the 2021 International Fire Code published by the

International Code Council.

11-201(a)10.




Dated this 5™ day of June 2023.

ATTEST:
/s/ Monna Van Lint, Finance Officer

Passed First Reading: May 1, 2023

Passed Second Reading: June 5, 2023

Yeas: 6 Nays: 0

Published: June 15, 2023

Effective: July 6, 2023

(Published at an approximate cost of $ )

/s/ Brit Miller, Mayor



